W= o Slo TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

d ShT
CThe Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
9T [I—@Us 3—3U-Jug (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
IR | WehTToTa

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 30] ¢ faoett, ggam, et 14, 2015/4919 24, 1936
No. 30] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, JANUARY 14, 2015/PAUSHA 24, 1936

R R e

EIEEE]
7% feeett, 13 STwast, 2015

ar.#[. 32(37).—FF arga [, 1937 &7 S Hemed T & o0 Hded Faei 1 9=
ATLAT ATA=H, 1934 (1934 F71 XXI) FF g=T 14 FF ATATHAR AT TLH, AR A7 T it
A 12 F94a%, 2014 Fir ATEg=AT 7, 90ALE. 794(37) % T wahrioq o wu, S uw saEaar 5w
ITH TATET S AT FATIAT &, & TS H 6 ATIGAAT 6 THIAT 2 6 19 faet it srafer i qonfea &
TS ST S TATT AHET FA g7 T F TSI T TAIT AT €T T ITA8 FTS T,

siiv ok 3o srfarg=eT i wfaet 12 999T, 2014 T AT ®T T IqeleE T &F TS of;

i i 3o srfarg=mT § fafafse safar % siew urea Mt o w@de ®§ Bl =afea & s sma
AT T T g0 &

A, AT, TR FCHE, IFT ATLAT ATATAIH 6T 7T 5 FIT & AfFadi & TINT FLd gC arATH
Ao 1937 ¥ 37 ot "etas F3 & fory fAeaferfera Fas aardt 8, seriq—

1. (1) == FF|T F7 "@ferd a9 agae (Faree) =24, 2015 2
(2) T FLHTLT TSATS § THTAA hl ATLE T T gl

201 GI/2015 (1)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART ITI—SEC. 3(i)]

FTA 9w, 1937 7 -
(F) T7=m 397 H, arfersrt ®, & (3) ® wiafte (i) F amae “gr a9 oreal & T U< “UT=F 9 oTeal &l
et o s,
(@) == 42 -
) ST-F=H (1) ®, TAY IqF & 99T, Mg uieqed sa et AT S,
AT —

N

“qeeq T 3T ST T I q9T § ST FEATEtS qETET WA ATTOTISAE ST T fohet
AEEERT 5T g1 ST AfSATT quqen arfuisas deta 9% IS FT L@l 8 AT
AT AT o AATHL & (1T ag IS AT o0l TULATH Hl T FAT &, STl AT
AT IS T AT T THTT &f TS § al STl Aedh Sid AT TAT P Aglaerd
AF9TF T, F T9ATT T il ST T (17}
(i)  HISET L TOqE |, T T AT 7 orex % T UY “uReq A8 S of R ereat
1 gfaeerrfog e so;
@) e 133%F % qeaTa, 9 XI-7 F ofi §,"9THS” orex F T 9T HAAA” 9Te] Wiaedarraa oA
S,
(&) P 13394 -
i) -7 (1) ®, @ (F) H, 37-U< (v) §, HISET 978 & T\ W Aeeed 39-9S
gfaeefua o ST, srata—

“(v) |t T e e wfererr e

(i)  Su-4Ew (3%) ®, “UF U A1 ST A AT T UL T &, ool F T\ I¢ I
Y Qreal Fl StaeaTa T S,

(i) 3IT-FEW (4) #, gT (9) §,"97 T FEme @R oest F e 9w A faume
AT ereai &l Tiaearioa fBhar S,

(v) 3T (9) ¥ i SU-fAaw (10) F @ (F) §, AT ISAANIAT TUATHA” 9T=al &
TITH I¥ “AT 0T rueqren” orsat st Tfawioa & siro;

(F) AT || |, FATATT T 3/ ‘T |, &< (2) §,—

) ST-EE (F) H, ‘YT AT FLAT” 951 6 T IL FHL: “STHLOT LT T FT
TETYTAYE & H T FAT” 5al & Traeriog & sio;

(i)  SU-ET (@) H “FART F [T Ae@T e AT AT 87 Qeal o6 T I¢ “FHHT:
STFHTIT LI TLIEA0T 33T 3T 7 eTeal hl TiedTiia fohat S

(i)  IT-EE (M) H T FT TSRO TSl F AT UL FHI: “TARLOT LI G0 9real
T StaearTtaa o s,




[T IT-T0€ 3 (i) ] AR ol TSI« STHEROT 3

(&) aggAT X H -

@) “SIAT T 9167 STgl Fgl AraT ¢, qeT “TawT J=rersh THorT=” ereat & qiaerod
[ERUE LIS

() T 1 F ARA H, “AgAT q5% F TE W “THE T=eE W oeai i
et R s,

(i) T 5T, G@F (3) H, “TSAIH gL BUT” Aeal F TATH UL “T=H AT T 9Tea) hl
faeaTa T s,

(v) T 5, 9T (4) F v WX fAetafeg g yfaeenfia Grar s, staia—

“(4) forET I=TE THTOMTT ST &3 & o0 & 1§97 3T IHF TR0
T &8 A ®qU i B 9T R,

(v) T8 d, gT (2)H, su-gE (vii)Fr T G S
(vi) =T 10 F w1 wx, Awterfea tey afeeenfug B smo,) srafa—

10 oA J=Te® TR | UHT G347 S qeTHeer® g fAtea & 5w, AfEa
gT;
(vii) T 13, 14, 17 < 19 7 09 BT S
(viii) T 20 ¥, IT-@E (1) ®, “Av fFuma Fanr oeet F o uw, A e
IR ereai &l Tiaearioa BT S,
(ix) 21 % v Al G afoenfi & s, saiq—

21 T8 T THIIT FT 91, ST AT Al T Tl Dl TgATd & (org UHT
A0 ST AT g fafRtdse $i s, Aearfa wam”

[T, 7. 7. 11012/03/2014-1]
FEIT FHT, HYFT A=

e fem arire 23 w19, 1937 it sfag=mT dear @1-26 % T 91 o oI § TR
o o o 3w sifaw geem 9 10 8, 2013 &1 9T F TSI, A|TLTI0T, -1,
dT 3, 37-9¢ (1) § Farfora ar.ar.f. €. 213(3r), grar fFu o)



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART ITI—SEC. 3(i)]

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 13th January, 2015

G.S.R. 32(E).—Whereas the draft of certain rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937, was
published, as required by Section 14 of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (XXII of 1934), vide notification of the
Government of India in the Ministry of Civil Aviation, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary Part-
II, Section 3, sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 794(E), dated 12th November, 2014, for inviting objections
and suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby before the expiry of the period of thirty days
from the date on which copies of the Gazette of India in which the said notification was published, were made
available to public;

And whereas copies of the Gazette in which the said notification was published were made available
to the public on the 12th November, 2014;

And whereas no objections or suggestions have been received from the public in respect of the draft
rules within the period specified in the said notification;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by Section 5 of the said Aircraft Act, the Central
Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937, namely: —

1. (D) These rules may be called the Aircraft (Amendment) Rules, 2015.

2 They shall come into force on the date of their final publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Aircraft Rules, 1937,—

(a) in rule 39C, in the table against entry (i) in column (3), for the words “Two years” the words,
“Five years” shall be substituted;

(b) in rule 42,—

(1) in sub-rule (1), after second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely.—

“Provided also that, in case where the holder of expired Indian commercial licence is flying
on a valid equivalent commercial licence issued by a Contracting State and satisfies the requirement
of flying experience for renewal of Indian licence, his Indian licence, if expired beyond two years,
shall be renewed after his qualifying the examinations and tests as the Director-General may consider
necessary:”;

(ii) in the existing third proviso, for the words “Provided further that”, the words
“Provided also that” shall be substituted;

(c) after rule 133A, in the heading for PART XII-B, for the word, “NORMAL” the word
“MANUAL” shall be substituted;

(d) in rule 133B,—

1) in sub-rule (1), in clause (a), in sub-clause (v), after the existing texts the following
sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(v)  training schools for all aviation subjects;”.

(i1) in sub-rule (3A), for the words “one year” at both places where they occur, the words
“five years” shall be substituted,;

(ii1) in sub-rule (4), in clause (b), for the words, “ Civil Aviation Department,” the words
“Directorate General of Civil Aviation’ shall be substituted;

@iv) in sub-rule (9), and in clause (a) of sub-rule (10), for the words “Civil Airworthiness
Requirements” the words, “Civil Aviation Requirements” shall be substituted;

(e) in Schedule II, in sections ‘O’ and ‘P’, in clause (2),—

1) in sub-clause (a), for the words, “issue of the rating” the words, “the satisfactory
completion of the instrument rating test” shall respectively be substituted;



[9/ I-8v€ 3 (i)] YA R TSIYA : STHTERT 5

(i1) in sub-clause (b) for the words, “application for renewal has been submitted” the
words “test for instrument rating has been conducted” shall respectively be substituted;

(ii1) in sub-clause (c) for the words, “ renewal of rating” the words, “the instrument rating
test” shall respectively be substituted;

® in Schedule XI,—
@) the word “permit” wherever it occurs, the words, “Air Operator Certificate” shall be
substituted;
(ii) In paragraph 1, in the beginning, for the word “Permission” the words “Air Operator
Certificate” shall be substituted;
(iii) in paragraph 5, in clause (3), for the words, “rupees twenty five thousand” words, “fifty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted;
@iv) in paragraph 5, for clause (4), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“(4) A fee of rupees twenty lakhs shall be payable for the issuance of an Air Operator
Certificate and rupees ten lakhs shall be payable for renewal thereof;”.
) in paragraph 8, in clause (2), sub clause (vii) shall be omitted;
(vi) for paragraph 10, the following paragraph shall be substituted, namely:—
“10. The Air Operator certificate shall contain such information as prescribed by the Director
General;”.
(vil)  paragraphs 13, 14, 17 and 19 shall be omitted;
(viii)  in paragraph 20, in sub-clause (1) for the words, “Civil Aviation Department,” the words,
“Directorate General of Civil Aviation” shall be substituted;
(ix) for paragraph 21, the following paragraph shall be substituted, namely:—
“21.  The holder of an Air Operator Certificate shall perform such services for conveyance
of mail or any other items as specified by the Director General.”.
[F. No. AV.11012/03/2014-A]
ARUN KUMAR, Jt. Secy.
Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, vide notification number V-26, dated

the 23rd March, 1937 and last amended by vide G.S.R. 213(E), published in the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), dated the 10th April, 2013.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



